
SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR 

GAZETTE 
 

No. 5245    GIBRALTAR   Thursday 31st July 2025 

 

 

LEGAL NOTICE NO. 200 OF 2025 

 

 

TRANSPORT ACT 1998 

 

TRANSPORT (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2025 

 

In exercise of the powers conferred on him by section 69 of the Transport Act 1998, and all 

other enabling powers, the Minister has made the following Regulations- 

 

Title. 

 

1.  These Regulations may be cited as the Transport (Amendment) Regulations 2025. 

 

Commencement. 

 

2.  These Regulations come into operation on 1st August 2025. 

 

Amendment to the Transport Regulations 2000. 

 

3.(1)  The Transport Regulations 2000 are amended in accordance with this regulation. 

 

  (2)  In regulation 107- 

 

(a) in subregulation (1), for “£50” substitute “£51.50”; and 

 

(b) in subregulation (6), for “£25” substitute “£26.00”. 

 

  (3)  In regulation 107A- 

 

(a) in subregulation (2), for “£20” substitute “£20.50”; 

 

(b) in subregulation (3), for “£10” substitute “£10.50”. 

 

  (4)  For Schedule 5, substitute- 

 

“ 

SCHEDULE 5 

 

Fees 

 

ROAD SERVICE LICENCES 

 

   



 

Gibraltar Gazette, No. 5245, Thursday 31st July 2025 

 

 2

£ 

1  For every application for a road service licence 51.50 

2  For every road service licence (per vehicle) 257.50 

3 For every transfer of a road service licence . 257.50 

4 For every duplicate road service licence 26.00 

5 For every application for the amendment of a road service licence (other 

than an application under section 17(6)(b) of the Act) 

62.00 

6 For every renewal of a road service licence 144.00 

7 For every application for the amendment of a road service licence under 

section 17(6)(b) of the Act 

5.00 

 

HORSE DRAWN VEHICLES. 

 

  £ 

1 Licence for hackney carriage 10.50 

2 Licence for horse drawn vehicle other than hackney carriage 5.00 

3 Licence to drive hackney carriage 2.00 

4 For a duplicate of any licence 2.00 

 

LICENCES TO DRIVE AND CONDUCT PUBLIC  

SERVICE VEHICLES. 

 

  £ 

1 For a licence to drive 26.00 

1A For a chauffeur licence 20.50 

2 For a licence to act as conductor 20.50 

3  For a duplicate of any licence 20.50 

4 For renewal of licence 26.00 

 

OPERATOR LICENCES 

 

  £ 

1 For every application for an operator licence  51.50 

2 For every operator licence 257.50 

3  For every transfer of operator licence 257.50 

4 For a duplicate operator licence 26.00 

5 For every application for the amendment of an operator licence 51.50 

6 For every renewal of an operator licence 

 

Note. 

 

This paragraph applies to every operator licence other than a chauffeur-

driven hire care operator’s licence as set out below. 

103.00 

 

 

 



 

Gibraltar Gazette, No. 5245, Thursday 31st July 2025 

 

 3

CHAUFFEUR-DRIVEN HIRE CAR OPERATOR’S LICENCES 

 

  £ 

1 For every application for a chauffeur-driven hire car operator’s licence 257.50 

2 For a duplicate chauffeur-driven hire car operator’s licence 26.00 

3 For every application for the amendment of a chauffeur-driven hire car 

operator’s licence 
10.50 

4 For every renewal of a chauffeur-driven hire car operator’s licence. 103.00 

 

”. 

 

Dated: 31st July 2025. 

 

 

 

 

 

PROF. J CORTES, 

Minister with responsibility for Transport. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM 

 

These regulations amend the Transport Regulations 2000. 

 


