
FIRST SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR  
GAZETTE 

No. 2,556 of 14th JUNE, 1990 
 
 
 

 
     I ASSENT, 
  
       DEREK REFFELL 
 
       GOVERNOR. 
 
        14th June, 1990. 
 
 
 

 

 
 

GIBRALTAR 
 

No. 32 of 1990. 
 

AN ORDINANCE to amend the Town Planning Ordinance and to make 
amendments consequential thereto. 

 
ENACTED by the Legislature of Gibraltar. 
 
Title and commencement 
 
1. (1) This Ordinance may be cited as the Town Planning (Amendment) 
Ordinance, 1990. 
 
 
 
 
 
 



32 of 1990] Town Planning (Amendment) Ordinance. 1990. 
 
 

  

 (2) This Ordinance shall come into operation on such day as the Governor 
may by notice in the Gazette appoint and different days may be so appointed 
for different purposes. 
 
Amendment to Section 5 
 
2. Section 5 of the Town Planning Ordinance (hereinafter called "the 
principal Ordinance") is amended— 
 

(a) by omitting in subsection (2), paragraph (c), the words 
"Director of Public Works" and substituting therefor the words 
"Town Planner or such other person as may be appointed for 
the purpose by the Government"; 

 
(b)  by omitting in subsection (4) the words "Director of Public 

Works" and substituting therefor the words "Town Planner or 
such other person as may be appointed for the purpose by the 
Government". 

 
Amendment to Section 13 
 
3. Section 13 of the principal Ordinance is amended— 
 

(a)  by omitting in subsection (2) the words "Director of Crown 
Lands" and substituting therefor the words "Town Planner or 
such other person as may be appointed for the purpose by the 
Government”; 

 
(h) by omitting in subsection (4) the words "Director of Crown 

Lands" and substituting therefor the words "Town Planner or 
such other person as may be appointed for the purpose by the 
Government 

 
Amendment to Section 14 
 
4. Section 14 of the principal Ordinance is amended— 
 

(a)  by omitting in subsection (1) the words "Director of Public 
Works" and substituting therefor the words "Town Planner or 
such other person as may be appointed for the purpose by the 
Government"; 



32 of 1990] Town Planning (Amendment) Ordinance. 1990. 
 
 

  

 
(b)  by omitting in subsection (2) the words "Director of Public 

Works" and substituting therefor "Town Planner or such other 
person as may be appointed for the purpose ,by the 
Government". 

 
Amendment to Section 18A 
 
5. Section 18A of the principal Ordinance is amended by omitting in 
subsection (1) the words "Director of Public Works" and substituting 
therefor the words "Town Planner or such other person as may be appointed 
for the purpose by the Government". 
 
Amendment to Section 25. 
 
6. Section 25 of the principal Ordinance is amended by omitting in 
subsection (1) the word "Governor" and substituting therefor the word 
"Government". 
 
Amendment to Section 29. 
 
7. Section 29 of the principal Ordinance is amended— 
 

(a)  by omitting the figure "£100" and substituting therefor the 
figure "£1,000"; 

 
(b)  by omitting the figure "£10" and substituting therefor the 

figure "£100". 
 

Amendment to Section 30. 
 
8. Section 30 of the principal Ordinance is amended— 
 

(a)  by omitting in subsection (1) the word "Governor" and 
substituting therefor the word "Government"; 

 
(b)  by omitting in paragraph (f) of subsection (1) the word 

"Governor" and substituting therefor the word "Government"; 
 
(c)  by omitting subsection (2). 

 



32 of 1990] Town Planning (Amendment) Ordinance. 1990. 
 
 

  

Amendment to Section 31. 
 
9. Section 31 of the principal Ordinance is amended— 
 

(a)  by omitting the figure "(1)"; 
 
(b)  by omitting in subsection (1) the word "Governor" and 

substituting therefore the word "Government"; 
  
(c)  by omitting subsection (2) 
 

Amendment to Schedule.  
 
10. The Schedule to the principal Ordinance is amended 
 

(a) in paragraph 1 by— 
 
(i) omitting the figure "(1) "; 
 
(ii) omitting in subparagraph (1) (b) the word "two" and 

substituting therefor the word "four"; 
 
 (iii) omitting in subparagraph (1) (d) the semi-colon and  

substituting therefor a full stop; 
 
(iv) omitting subparagraphs (1) (e) and (l) (f); 
 
(v)  omitting subparagraph (2) 
 
(b)  by omitting in paragraph 4 the words "Director of Crown 

Lands" and substituting therefor the words "Town Planner or 
such other person as the Government may appoint for the 
purpose". 

 
Amendment to the Civil Air Terminal Ordinance. 
 
11. The Civil Air Terminal Ordinance is amended— 
 

(a)  in Section 2 by omitting from the interpretation of "Civil Air 
Terminal" the words "office of the Director of Crown Lands" 



32 of 1990] Town Planning (Amendment) Ordinance. 1990. 
 
 

  

and substituting therefor the words "offices of the 
Government";  

(b)  in Section 7 by omitting the words "Director of Crown Lands" 
and substituting therefor the words "Town Planner or such 
other person as may, be appointed by the Government for that 
purpose". 

 
Amendment to the Income Tax Ordinance 
 
12. The Income Tax Ordinance is amended in Section 26A by omitting in 
subsection (5) the words "Director of Crown Lands" where they appear in 
paragraphs (a) and (b) and substituting therefor the words "Town Planner or 
such other person as the Government may appoint for the purpose" in each 
such place. 
 
Amendment to the Land (Acquisition) Ordinance 
 
13. The Land (Acquisition) Ordinance is amended in Section 2 by omitting 
in the interpretation of "Director" the words "Director of Crown Lands" and 
substituting therefor the words "Town Planner or such other person as the 
Government may appoint for this purpose". 
 
Amendment to the Landlord and Tenant Ordinance 
 
14. The Landlord and Tenant Ordinance is amended— 
 

(a)  in Section 5 by omitting 
  
 (i) the figure "(1)"; 
 
 (ii) subsection (2); 
 
(b)  in Section 22 by omitting in subsection (3) the words 

"Director of Crown Lands" and substituting therefor the words 
"Town Planner or such other person as may be appointed by 
the Government for this purpose". 

 
Amendment the Public Health Ordinance. 
 
15. (1) The Public Health Ordinance (in this section called "the Ordinance") 
is amended in section 2 by omitting in ' the interpretation of "public 



32 of 1990] Town Planning (Amendment) Ordinance. 1990. 
 
 

  

highways" the words "at the office of the Director of Crown Lands" and 
substituting therefor the words "in the Iffices of the Government". ` 
(2) Section 4 4 of the Ordinance is amended by omitting the words "at the 
office of the Director of Crown Lands" and substituting therefor the Words 
"in the offices of the Government". 
 
(3) Section 269 of the Ordinance is amended in paragraph (b) by omitting 
the words "at the office of the Director of Crown Lands" and substituting 
therefor the words "in the offices of the Government". 
 
(4) Section 271 of the Ordinance is amended in the proviso to subsection (4) 
by omitting the words "with the Director of Crown Lands" and substituting 
therefor the words "in the offices of the Government". 
 
(5) Section 279 of the Ordinance is amended by omitting in paragraph. (i) 
the words "with the Director of Crown Lands" and substituting therefor the 
words "in the offices of the Government". 
 
(6) Section 293 of the Ordinance is amended in the proviso to subsection (3) 
by omitting the words "with the Director of Crown Lands" and substituting 
therefor the words "in the offices of the Government". 
 
(7) Section 301A of the Ordinance is amended in subsection (I) by— 
 

(a) omitting in paragraph (a) the words "Director of Crown 
Lands" and substituting therefor the words "Town Planner or 
such other person as the Government may appoint for the 
purpose"; 

 
(b) inserting in paragraph (b) after the words "as such" the words 

"but shall not be associated with the person of the Valuation 
Officer". 

 
(8) Section 308 of the Ordinance is amended— 
 

(a)  in subsection (1) by— 
 
 (i)  omitting the word "ten" and substituting therefor the ord 

"five" 
 



32 of 1990] Town Planning (Amendment) Ordinance. 1990. 
 
 

  

 (ii)  by omitting the words "twenty-five pence" 
and substituting therefor the expression "2 or such other 
figure as the Government may by notice in the Gazette 
specify from time to time"; 

 
(b)  in subsection (2) by omitting the figure "£5" and substituting 

therefor the figure "£100" 
 

 (9) Section 314 of the Ordinance is amended by inserting after the words 
"the Government" in the two places where these words appear, the words "or 
such agent as may be appointed by the Government for this purpose". 
 
(10) Section 316 of the Ordinance is amended in subsection (1) by inserting 
after the word "officer" the words "or agent". 
 
(1 1) Section 317 of the Ordinance is amended— 
 

(a)  in subsection (1) by inserting after the word "officer" the 
words "or agent"; 

 
(b)  in subsection (2) by omitting the words "expressed to hold an 

office by virtue of which he is" and substituting therefor the 
words "or agent of the Government". 

 
(12) Section 320 of the Ordinance is amended in subsections (1), (2), (3) and 
(7) by inserting after the word "officer" where it appears in each of these 
subsections the words "or agent". 
 
Amendment to the Licensing and Fees Ordinance. 
 
16. The Licensing and Fees Ordinance is amended by inserting in Section 37 
after the word "Government" the words "or to such person as may be 
appointed by the Governor by notice in the Gazette,". 
 

________________ 
 
Passed by the Gibraltar House of Assembly on the 30th day of May, 1 
1990. 
 

C. M COOM 
 



32 of 1990] Town Planning (Amendment) Ordinance. 1990. 
 
 

  

Clerk to the Assembly. 
 


