SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR

GAZETTE
No. 2,462 of 24" November, 1988.

LEGAL NOTICE No. 120 OF 1988.

SOCIAL SECURITY (EMPLOYMENT INJURIESINSURANCE)
ACT.

EMPLOYMENT INJURIES (BENEFITS) (AMENDMENT)
REGULATIONS, 1988.

In exercise of the powers conferred on him by Section 50 of the
Socia Security (Employment Injuries Insurance) Act, and of all other
enabling powers, the Governor has made the following regul ations:

Title and commencement.

1.(2) These regulations may be cited as the Employment Injuries
(Benefits) (Amendment) Regulations 1988.

(2) These regulations shall come into operation on the 1st day of
January 1989.

Amendment of Regulation 4.

2. Regulation 4 of the Employment Injuries (Benefits) Regulations
(hereinafter called the principal regulations) is amended-

(8 in paragraph (@), by omitting the expression "£18.20" and
substituting the expression "£19.10"

(b) in paragraph (b), by omitting the expression "£36.40" and
substituting the expression "£38.251".

Amendment of Regulation 8.
3. Regulation 8(b) of the principal regulations is amended by

omitting the expression "f23.90" and substituting the expression
"£25.10".



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 2,462, Thursday 24" November, 1988

Replacement of Schedule 2.

4. The principal regulations are further amended by revoking
Schedule 2, and substituting the following Schedule:

"SCHEDULE 2.
Maximum Weekly Rates of Injury Benefit Payable for Successive
Accidents.
Regulations 6(2)
1 2. 3.
Degree of Persons who have Persons who have
Disablement per attained the age of | attained the age of 15
centum 18. but are under 18.
£ £
30 13.00 10.30
25 10.90 8.40
20 8.70 6.70
15 6.60 5.00
10 4.80 3.40
5 2.50 1.70

Saving.

5.(1) The amendments effected to the principal regulations by
reulations 3 and 4 of these regulations shall not apply in respect
regulations shall not apply in respect of any accident or successive
accidents (as the case may be) occurring before the 1st day of
January, 1989.

(2) Theincreased rate of disablement pension under section 16 of
the Act shall be payable irrespective of the date of the accident.

Dated this 24th day of November, 1988.
By Command,

BRIAN TRAYNOR,
Acting Deputy Governor.




