
SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR 

GAZETTE 
No. 2,530 of 28th December, 1989. 

 

LEGAL NOTICE No. 115 0F 1989. 

 

SOCIAL SECURITY (EMPLOYMENT INJURIES INSURANCE) 

ACT. 

 

SOCIAL SECURITY (EMPLOYMENT INJURIES INSURANCE) 

(AMENDMENT OF CONTRIBUTIONS AND BENEFITS) ORDER; 

1989. 

 

In exercise of the powers conferred on me by section 55 of the Social 

Security (Employment Injuries Insurance) Act, I hereby issue the following 

notice: 

 

Title and commencement. 

 

1.(1) This order may be cited as the Social Security (Employment Injuries 

Insurance) (Amendment of Contributions and Benefits) Order, 1989. 

 

  (2) This order shall come into operation on Ist day of January, 1990. 

 

2. (1) The rates of benefits provided for by the amendments effected by this 

order (other than the benefits specified in sub-paragraph (2) shall apply only 

in respect of accidents that occur on or after the lst day of January, 1990. 

 

  (2) The following rates of benefit under the Social Security (Employment 

Injuries Insurance) Act (hereinafter called the Act) shall be payable 

irrespective of the date of the accident- 

 

(a) the rates of disablement pension under section 15; 

 

(b) the rates of dependants allowances under section 18 for 

beneficiaries entitled to disablement pension; 

 

(c) the rates of death pension and dependants allowances under 

section 19; and 

 

(d) an increase in disablement benefit resulting from the review of an 

assessment under section 37(2). 

 

Amendment of Section 16. 



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 2,530, Thursday 28th December, 1989. 

 

 2

 

3. Section 16(2) of the Act is amended by omitting the expressions "119. 10" 

and "£38.20" and substituting the expressions "£23.90" and "£47.80" 

respectively. 

 

Amendment of Section 19. 

 

4. Section 19 of the Act is amended- 

 

(a) in sub-section (1), by omitting the expression "£25.70", and 

substituting the expression "£32.10"; 

 

(b) in sub-section (2)(a) by omitting the expressions "£27.90" and 

"112,840" and substituting the expressions "£34.90" and 

"£16,050" respectively; 

 

(c) in sub-section (2)(b), by omitting the expression "£12,840" and 

substituting the expression "£16,050". 

 

Amendment of Section 20. 

 

5. Section 20 of the Act is amended by omitting the expression "£12.80" and 

substituting the expression "£16.00". 

 

Amendment of Section 21. 

 

6: Section 21 of the Act is amended- 

 

(a) in sub-section (4)(a), by omitting the expressions "£13.10" and 

"£19.50" and substituting the expressions "£16.40" and, 

"£24.40" respectively; 

 

(b) in sub-section (4)(b), by omitting the expression "£1440" and 

substituting the expression "£1800". 

 

Amendment of Section 22. 

 

7. Section 22(1) of the Act is amended by omitting the expression £1440", 

and substituting the expression £1800". 

 

Amendment of Schedule 1. 

 



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 2,530, Thursday 28th December, 1989. 

 

 3

8. Schedule 1 to the Act is amended by omitting Part I and substituting the 

following Part: 

December, 1989. 

 

"PART I.  

 

CONTRIBUTION RATES. 

 

Sections 5 & 6 

 

Class of Insured Person to 

whom rate applies 
Weekly rate of Contribution 

 By the Insured By the 

 person (2) Employer (3) 

Persons who have attained the   

age of 18 years. 25p 25p 

Persons who have attained the   

age of 15 years but are under 18. 23p 23p 

 

Amendment of Schedule 2. 

 

9. Schedule 2 to the Act is amended by omitting Parts I and II, and 

substituting the following Parts: 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

"PART I. 

 

INJURY BENEFIT. 



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 2,530, Thursday 28th December, 1989. 

 

 4

 

Section 14 

 

Rates of Injury Benefit. 

Class of Insured Persons Per Week Per Day 

Persons who have attained the   

age of 18 years. £56.70 f$.10 

' 

Persons who have attained the 
  

Persons who have attained the age of 

15 but are under 18. 
£42.70 £6.10 

 

PART II.  

 

DEPENDANTS ALLOWANCE. 

 

                                                                Section 18    

Class of Dependant Per Week  Per Day 

Dependent adult £12.25 £1.75 

Allowance for first dependent child £ 6.65 £0.95 

Allowance for second dependent 

child 
£ 4.20 £0.60 

 

Amendment of Schedule 3. 

 

10. Schedule 3 to the Act is amended by omitting everything  after the 

heading "Schedule 3", and substituting the following: 

 

 

"DISABLEMENT GRATUITY. 

 

Section 15(6) 

 



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 2,530, Thursday 28th December, 1989. 

 

 5

(1) 

Degree of 

disablement 

per centum 

(2) 

Amount of 

gratuity 

(3) 

Degree of 

disablement 

per centum 

(4) 

Amount of 

gratuity 

 £  £ 

1 330 18 3050 
2 480 19 3200 
3 630 20 3360 
4 790 21 3500 
5 950  22. 3680 
6 1090 23 3850 
7 1250 24 4000 
8 1400    25 .  4160 
y 1560   26 .   4300.. 

10 1710 27 4460 
11 1880 28 4630 
12 2050 29 4780 
13 2210 30 4930 
14 2390 31 5080 
15 2560 32 5240 
16 2710 33 5400 

            17 2880 34 5550 

 

Amendment of Schedule 4. 

 

11. Schedule 4 to the Act is amended by omitting everything after the 

heading "Schedule 4", and substituting the following: 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

"RATES OF DISABLEMENT PENSION. 

 

Section 15(7)(a) 

 



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 2,530, Thursday 28th December, 1989. 

 

 6

WEEKLY RATES 

1. 2. 3. 

Degree of Persons who have Persons who have 
disablement attained the attained the 
per centum age of 18. age of 15 but are 

  under 18. 

100 55.70 42.70 

95 54.30 40.90 
90 51.50 38.60 
85 48.60 36.50 
80 45.60 34.40 
75 42.80 32.10 
70 40.00 30.00 
65 37.30 28.00 
60 34.30 25.90 
55 31.50 23.80 
50 28.50 21.60 
45 25.90 ' 19A0 
40 22.90 17:40 

35 20.10 15.00 

 

Amendment of Schedule 5. 

 

12. Schedule 5 to the Act is amended by omitting everything after the 

heading "Schedule 5", and substituting the following: 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

"DISABLEMENT GRATUITY  

 

Section 15(7)(b) 

 



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 2,530, Thursday 28th December, 1989. 

 

 7

Degree of 

disablement 

per centum 

Amount-of: 

gratuity, 

Degree of 

disablement 

per centum 

Amount of 

gratuity 

1 2. 3. 4. 

35 5760 68 11060 

36 5900 69 11240 
37 6060 70 11400 
38 6240 71 11580 
39 6400 72 11730 
40 6560 73 11880 
41 6730 74 12040 
42 6880 75 12190 
43 7040 76 12360 
44 7200 77 12530 
45 7380 78 12690 
46 7550 79 12840 
47 7690 80 13010 
48 7850 81 13180 
49 800Q 82 13340 
50 8180 83 13490 
51 8330 84 13650 
52 8490 95 13830 
53 8660 86 13960 
54 8830 87 14110 
55 8980 88 14280 
56 9150 89 14440 
57 9290 90 14600 
58 9460 91 14760 
59 9640 92 14930 
60 9790 93 15080 
61 9950 94 15240 
62 10090 95 15410 
63 10250 96 15580 
64 10430 97 15730 
65 10590 98 15900 
66 10760 99 16050 

67 10910 100 16050 

 

Dated this 28th day of December, 1989. 

 

ROBERT MOR, 

Minister responsible for the administration of the Social Security 

(Employment Injuries Insurance) Act. 


