
SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR 

GAZETTE 
 

No. 5019    GIBRALTAR    Thursday 22nd December 2022 

 

 

 

LEGAL NOTICE NO. 341 OF 2022 

 

 

PUBLIC HEALTH ACT 

 

PUBLIC HEALTH (PROVISION OF HEARSES) (AMENDMENT) RULES 2022 

 

In exercise of the powers conferred upon it by sections 178 and 337 of the Public Health Act 

the Government has made the following Rules- 

 

Title. 

 

1.  These Rules may be cited as the Public Health (Provision of Hearses) (Amendment) Rules 

2022. 

 

Commencement. 

 

2.  These Rules come into operation on the date of publication. 

 

Amendment to rules. 

 

3.  The Schedule to the Public Health (Provision of Hearses) Rules, 1995 is amended as 

follows- 

 

(a) in the first paragraph for “£40” substitute “£65”; and 

 

(b) in the second paragraph for “£30” substitute “£49”. 

 

 

Dated: 22nd December 2022 

 

 

 

Prof J Cortes 

For the Government 

 

 

 

____________________________ 

 

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM 

 

These Rules amend the charges payable when the Chief Environmental Health Officer 

provides a hearse. 


