SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR
GAZETTE

No. 5245 GIBRALTAR Thursday 31st July 2025

LEGAL NOTICE NO. 198 OF 2025

PUBLIC HEALTH ACT
BUILDING WORKS (HOARDINGS AND FENCES) (AMENDMENT) RULES 2025

In exercise of its powers under sections 42 and 337 of the Public Health Act, and all other
enabling powers, the Government has made the following Rules—

Title.

1. These Rules may be cited as the Building Works (Hoardings and Fences) (Amendment)
Rules 2025.

Commencement.
2. These Rules come into operation on 1 August 2025.

Amendment to the Building Works (Hoardings and Fences) Rules 1994,

3.(1) The Building Works (Hoardings and Fences) Rules 1994 are amended in accordance
with this rule.

(2) Inrule 11—
(a) in subrule (1) —
(i)  in paragraph (a) for “£6,150” substitute “£6,335”;
(i1) in paragraph (b) for “£6,150” substitute “£6,335”;
(b) in subrule (2), for “£46” substitute “£47”.
Dated: 31% July 2025.
G ARIAS VASQUEZ

Minister with responsibility for Town Planning,
For the Government.

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM

These Rules amend the Building Works (Hoardings and Fences) Rules 1994,



