
SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR 

GAZETTE 
 

No. 5124    GIBRALTAR    Thursday 25th January 2024 

 

 

 

LEGAL NOTICE NO. 7 OF 2024 

 

 

PUBLIC FINANCE (CONTROL AND AUDIT) ACT 

 

PROCUREMENT (PUBLIC SECTOR CONTRACTS) (AMENDMENT) 

REGULATIONS 2024 

 

In exercise of the powers conferred on it by section 75 of the Public Finance (Control and 

Audit) Act and all other enabling powers, the Minister with responsibility for Finance has 

made the following Regulations– 

 

Title. 

 

1.  These Regulations may be cited as the Procurement (Public Sector Contracts) (Amendment) 

Regulations 2024. 

 

Commencement. 

 

2.  These Regulations come into operation on the day of publication. 

 

Amendment of Procurement (Public Sector Contracts) Regulations 2016. 

 

3.(1)  The Procurement (Public Sector Contracts) Regulations 2016 are amended in accordance 

with this regulation. 

 

  (2)  In regulation 7, subregulation (1)– 

 

(a) in paragraph (a), for “£5,336,937” substitute “£5,372,609”; 

 

(b in paragraph (b), for “£138,760” substitute “£139,688”; and 

 

(c) in paragraph (c), for “£213,447” substitute “£214,904”. 
 

 

Dated: 25th January 2024. 
 

 

 

 

F R PICARDO, 

Minister with responsibility for Finance. 

 

 



 

Gibraltar Gazette, No. 5124, Thursday 25th January 2024 

 

 2

 

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM 

 

These Regulations amend the Procurement (Public Sector Contracts) Regulations 2016 in 

order to update the threshold amounts. 
 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 


