SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR

GAZETTE
No. 3,162 of 20th April, 2000

LEGAL NOTICE NO. 30 OF 2000
PRISON ACT
PRISON (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS, 2000
In exercise of the powers conferred on him by section 75 of the Prison Act,
and of all other enabling powers, the Governor has made the following
regulations -

Title.

1. These regulations may be cited as the Prison (Amendment)
Regulations, 2000.

Amendment to regulation 61.
2. Regulation 61 of the Prison regulations is amended -
(a) in sub-regulation (2) by -

6)] omitting the figure “£2.50” and substituting therefor
the figure “£6.00”;

(i1) omitting in paragraph (a) the figure “£2.25” and
substituting therefor the figure £3.50;

(b) in sub-regulation (3) by -

6)] omitting the figure “£2.50” and substituting therefor
the figure “£6.00;

(i) omitting after the word “cook” the word “or” and
substituting therefor a comma followed by the
expression “£5.00 in the case of”.

(iii) omitting the expression “90 pence” and substituting
therefor the expression “£2.50”;

(iv) omitting the expression “70 pence” and substituting
therefor the expression “£2.00”;



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 3,162, Thursday 20th April, 2000

() in sub-regulation (7) by omitting the figure “£1.80” and
substituting therefor the figure “£4.00”;

(d) in sub-regulation (8) by -

6)] inserting after the expression “(2)” the expression “or
3)7
(i) omitting the expression “50 pence” and substituting

therefor the figure “£1.50”.

Dated this 20th day of April, 2000

By Command,
P. SPELLER,

Deputy Governor.



