SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR

GAZETTE
No. 2,953 of 19th December, 1996.

LEGAL NOTICE NO. 119 OF 1996.

POST OFFICE ACT

COMMONWEALTH AND FOREIGN POST (AMENDMENT)
REGULATIONS 1996

In exercise of the powers conferred on him by section 54 of the Post Office
Act, and of al other enabling powers, the Governor has made the following
regulations -

Titleand commencement.

1. These regulations may be cited as the Commonwealth and Foreign Post
(Amendment) Regulations 1996, and shall come into effect on the 1st day of
January 1997.

Amendment to regulation 10.

2. Regulation 10 of the Commonwealth and Foreign Post Regulations
(hereinafter called “the principal Regulations™) is amended in sub-regulation

(1) by -

(@ omitting in paragraph (a) the figure “70” and substituting
therefor the figure “82”;

(b) omitting in paragraph (b) the figure “80” and substituting
therefor the figure “93”.

Amendment to regulation 22.
3. Regulation 22 of the principal Regulations is amended by omitting the
words “ten” and “thirteen” and substituting therefor the words “twelve” and

“fifteen”.

Amendment to regulation 27.



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 2,953, Thursday 19th December,1996.

4. Regulation 27 of the principal Regulations is amended by omitting the
figure “£1.20” and substituting therefor the figure “£1.40”.

Amendment to regulation 30.

5. Regulation 30 of the principal Regulations is amended in sub-regulation
(2)(c) by omitting the figure “£1.05” and substituting therefor the figure
“£1.20”.

Amendment to regulation 31.

6. Regulation 31 of the principal Regulations is amended by omitting the
figure “£18” and substituting therefor the figure “£21”.

Amendment to regulation 37.
7. Regulation 37 of the principal Regulationsis amended -

(& in sub-regulation (1) by omitting the word “thirty” and
substituting therefor the words “thirty-five”;

(b) in sub-regulation (2) by omitting the words “thirty-five” and
substituting therefor the word “sixty”;

(c) in sub-regulation (4) by omitting the words “forty-eight” and
substituting therefor the figure “£1.00”.

Amendment to regulation 39.

8. Regulation 39 of the principal Regulations is amended by omitting the
words “fifty-five” and substituting therefor the word “seventy”.

Amendment to Schedule 1.

9. Schedule 1 to the principal Regulations is amended by omitting items 1
and 2 and substituting therefor the following items -

“1. Letters including letter packets -

Weight not over Rate of Postage



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 2,953, Thursday 19th December,1996.

20 grammes 24p
100 grammes 57p
250 grammes £1.15p
500 grammes £2.22p
1000 grammes £3.84p
2000 grammes £6.23p
2. Postcards 24p”.

Replacement of Schedule 2.

10. The principal Regulations are further amended by revoking Schedule 2
thereof, and substituting therefor the following new Schedule -

“SCHEDULE 2
Regulation 5
AIRMAIL RATES OF POSTAGE ON POSTAL PACKETSPOSTED
IN GIBRALTAR
PART IA
EUROPE
Destination Description Rate of Postage
Countries which are (a) Lettersincluding letter
members of the European packets -

Economic Community
(i) For thefirst 20
grammes or part 26p
thereof
(ii) For every 10 grammes
or part thereof after
the 12p
first 20 grammes

(b) Postcards conforming in
all respectsto the
regulations relating 26p
thereto



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 2,953, Thursday 19th December,1996.

(c) Air letters conforming in
all respectsto the
regulations relating 24p
thereto

(d) For the purpose of Part
IA, countriesare as
follows -

EEC

Austria
Belgium
Denmark
Finland
France
Germany
Great Britain
Greece

Italy

Irdland
Luxembourg
Netherlands
Portugal
Spain
Sweden

PART 1B
EUROPE

Destination Description Rate of Postage

Countries which are not (a) Lettersincluding Letter
members of the European Packets -
Economic Community
(i) forthefirst 20
grammes or part
thereof 28p

(ii) for every 10 grammes
or part thereof after
the first 20 grammes 12p



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 2,953, Thursday 19th December,1996.

(b) Postcards conformingin
all respectsto the

regulations relating thereto 28p
(c) Air Letters conforming in all

respects to the regulations

relating thereto 26p

(d) For the purpose of Part IB
countries are as follows -

NON-EEC EUROPEAN

Albania Macedonia
Andorra Malta
Armenia Moldova
Azerbaidjan Monaco
Belarus Norway
Bosnia -
Herzegovina  Ouzbekistan
Bulgaria Poland
Cyprus Rumania
Croatia Russia
Estonia Slovakia
Faroeldands Slovenia
Georgia Switzerland
Hungary Tadjikistan
Iceland Tcheque
Kazakhstan Turkey
Kirghizistan =~ Turkmenistan
Lettonia Ukraine
Liechtenstein  Vatican
Lithuania Yugoslavia
PART Il

COUNTRIES OUTSIDE EUROPE

Postal Packets -



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 2,953, Thursday 19th December,1996.

First 10 each additional 10 Air Letters Postcards
grammes or grammes or part thereof
part thereof
Zonel 30p 14p 30p 30p
Zone 2 35p 21p 30p 35p
(b) For the purposes of Part |1, countries are zoned as follows -
ZONE 1
ABU DHABI GABON RAS AL KHAIMAH
AFGHANISTAN GAMBIA REUNION
ALGERIA GAZA & KHAN YUNIS RWANDA
ANGOLA GHANA ST HELENA
ANGUILLA GRENADA STKITTS & NEVIS
ANTIGUA & GUATEMALA ST LUCIA
BARBUDA
ARUBA GUINEA ST PERRE &
MIQUELON
ARGENTINA GUINEA-BISSAU ST VINCENT &
ASCENSION GUYANA THE GRENADINES
BAHAMAS HAITI SAO TOME &
PRINCIPE
BAHRAIN HONDURAS SAUDI ARABIA
BANGLADESH HONG KONG SENEGAL
BARBADOS INDIA SEYCHELLES
BELIZE INDONESIA SHARJAH
BENIN IRAN SIERRA LEONE
BERMUDA IRAQ SINGAPORE
BHUTAN ISRAEL SOMALIA (DEM
REP)
BOLIVIA IVORY COAST SOUTH AFRICA
BOTSWANA JAMAICA SRI LANKA
BRAZIL JORDAN SUDAN
BRITISH INDIAN KENYA SURINAM
OCEAN TER.
BRITISH VIRGIN KUWAIT SWAZILAND
ISLANDS
BRUNEI LAOS SYRIA
BURKINA FASO LEBANON TANZANIA
BURMA (see LESOTHO THAILAND
MYANMAR)
BURUNDI LIBERIA TIBET



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 2,953, Thursday 19th December,1996.

CAMBODIA
CAMEROON

CANADA

CAYMAN ISLANDS
CENTRAL AFRICAN
REPUBLIC

CHAD

CHILE

CHRISTMAS ISLAND
(INDIAN OCEAN)
COCOS (KEELING
ISLANDS)
COLOMBIA
COMOROS

CONGO

COSTA RICA
CUBA
CURACAO

DJBOUTI

DOMINICA
DOMINICA REPUBLIC
DUBAI

ECUADOR

EGYPT

EL SALVADOR
EQUATORIAL
GUINEA

ETHIOPIA
FALKLAND ISLANDS
& DEPENDENCIES
FRENCH GUIANA
FRENCH WEST
INDIES

FUJAIRAH

LIBYAN SOC PEOPLES’
ARAB JAMAHIRIYA
MACAO

MADAGASCAR (DEM REP)

MALAWI

MALAYSIA (INC.
MALAYA)

SABAH AND SARAWAK

MALDIVES (REP OF)
MALI
MAURITANIA

MAURITIUS
MEXICO
MONTSERRAT

MOROCCO
MOZAMBIQUE
MYANMAR (FORM.
BURMA)

NAMIBIA

NEPAL
NETHERLANDS ANTILLES
NICARAGUA
NIGERIA

NIGER REPUBLIC
OMAN

PAKISTAN

PANAMA
PARAGUAY

PERU
PUERTO RICO

QATAR (STATE OF)

ZONE 2

TOGO (REP OF)

TRINIDAD &
TOBAGO
TRISTAN DA
CUNHA

TUNISIA
TURKS & CAICOS
ISLANDS
UGANDA

UMM AL
QAIWAN

UNITED ARAB
EMIRATES

USA
URUGUAY

VENEZUELA
VIETNAM
VIRGIN ISLANDS
OF USA

YEMEN (REP OF)
ZAIRE

ZAMBIA

ZIMBABWE



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 2,953, Thursday 19th December,1996.

AUSTRALIA
BELAU (PALAU)

CHINA (PEOPLES REP OF)
EAST TIMOR

Fla

FRENCH POLYNESIA

FRENCH SOUTHERN & ANTARCTIC
TERRITORIES

JAPAN
KIRIBATI

KOREA (REP OF)
KOREA (DEMOCRATIC
PEOPLES’ REP OF)
MARSHAL ISLANDS

MICRONESIA (FEDERATED STATES OF) -
Formerly CAROLINE ISLANDS

MONGOLIA

Replacement of Schedule 3.

NAURU ISLAND

NEW CALEDONIA

NEW ZEALAND

NEW ZEALAND ISLAND
TERRITORIES
NORFOLD ISLAND

NORTHERN MARIANA
ISLANDS

PAPUA NEW GUINEA
PHILIPPINES

PITCAIRN ISLANDS
SAMOA (AMERICAN)
SOLOMON ISLANDS
TAIWAN

TONGA

TUVALU

VANUATU

WAKE ISLAND
WALLIS & FUTUNA
ISLANDS

WESTERN SAMOA”.

11. The principal Regulations are further amended by revoking Schedule 3
thereof, and substituting therefor the following new Schedule -

“SCHEDULE 3

PART |

Regulations 6 & 7

RATES OF POSTAGE PAYABLE

PRINTED PACKETS

Weight not over

20 grammes 15p
100 grammes 28p
250 grammes 50p

Full Rate of Postage

Reduced Rate of Postage

12p
23p
43p



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 2,953, Thursday 19th December,1996.

500 grammes 86p 74p
1000 grammes £1.44p £1.24p
2000 grammes £2.00p £1.72p
3000 grammes £3.00p £2.60p
4000 grammes £4.00p £3.45p
5000 grammes £5.00p £4.33p

PART 11

SMALL PACKETS

Weight not over Rate of Postage
100 grammes 25p
250 grammes 49p
500 grammes 86p
1000 grammes £1.44p~.

Replacement of Schedule 5.

12. The principal Regulations are further amended by revoking Schedule 5
thereof, and substituting therefor the following new Schedule -

“SCHEDULE 5
Regulations 33 and 34
COMPENSATION
Compensation Fee M aximum Compensation
£1.50 £100
£2.00 £200
£2.50 £300
£3.00 £400
£3.50 £500
£4.00 £600
£4.50 £700
£5.00 £800
£5.50 £900
£6.00 £1000”.

Dated this 19th day of December, 1996.
9



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 2,953, Thursday 19th December,1996.

By Command,

M. J. ROBINSON,

Deputy Governor.

10



