SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR

GAZETTE
No. 2,277 of 27th FEBRUARY, 1986.

LEGAL NOTICE No. 14 OF 1986.
POST OFFICE ACT.

COMMONWEALTH AND FOREIGN POST (AMENDMENT)
REGULATIONS, 1986.

In exercise of the powers conferred on him by sections 5 and 54 of the Post
Office Act, and of all other enabling powers, the Governor has made the
following the regulations:-

Title and commencement.

1.(2) These regulations may be cited as the Commonwealth and Foreign Post
(Amendment) Regulations, 1986.

(2) These regulations shall come into operation on the 1st day of March,
1986.

Amendment of Regulation 10.

2. Regulations 10(1) of the Commonwealth and Foreign Post Regulations
(hereinafter called the principal regulations) is amended -

(i) in sub-regulation (a) thereof by omitting the figures
"30", and substituting therefor the figures "60";

(ii) in sub-regulations (b) thereof by omitting the
figures "36", and substituting therefor the figures
"70".

Amendment of Regulation 22.

3. Regulation 22 of the principal regulations is amended by omitting the

words "eight" and "nine", and substituting therefor the words "nine" and
"ten" respectively.

Amendment of Regulation 27.



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No. 2,277, Thursday 27th February, 1986.

4, Regulation 27 of the principal regulations is amended by omitting the
expression "£1.00", and substituting therefor the expression "£1.20".

Amendment of Regulation 30.

5. Regulation 30 (2) (c) of the principal regulations is amended by omitting
the word "eighty", and substituting therefor the expression "£1.00".

Amendment of Regulation 31.

6. Regulation 31 of the principal regulations is amended by omitting the
expression "£12", and substituting therefor the expression “£15”.

Amendment of Regulation 39.

7. Regulation 39 of the principal regulations is amended by omitting the
word "thirty" and substituting therefor the words "fifty five".

Amendment of Schedule 1.

8. Schedule 1 to the principal regulations is amended by omitting items 1 and
2 thereof, and substituting therefor the following new items:

"1. Lettersincluding letter packets -

Weight not over Rate of Postage
20 grammes 19p
100 grammes 44p
250 grammes 88p
500 grammes £1.70p
1000 grammes £2.93p
2000 grammes £A4.76p
2000 grammes 19p.”

Replacement of Schedule 2.

9. The principa regulations are further amended by revoking Schedule 2
thereof, and substituting therefor the following new Schedule:

"SCHEDULE 2

Regulation 5



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No. 2,277, Thursday 27th February, 1986.

AIRMAIL RATES OF POSTAGE ON POSTAL PACKETSPOSTED

Destination
Albania
Andorra
Austria

Azores
BalearicIs
Belgium
Bulgaria
Canary Is

Cape Verdels
Corsica

Cyprus
Czechoslovakia
Denmark
Faroels
Finland

France

German Dem Rep
Germany (Fed Rep of)
Greece
Greenland
Hungary
Iceland

Ireland (Republic of)
Italy
Liechtenstein
Luxembourg
Madeira

Malta

Monaco
Destination
Netherlands
Norway

Poland

IN GIBRALTAR.
PART I.
EUROPE.

Description

(a) Lettersincluding
letter packets:-

(i) For thefirst 20
grammes or part
thereof

(i) For every 10
grammes or part
thereof after the
first 20 grammes

(b) Postcards
conforming in all
respectsto the
regulations
relating thereto

Description

) (c) Air Letters

)  conforminginall

) respectsto the

)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)
)

3

Rate of postage

22p

10p

22p
Rate of postage



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No. 2,277, Thursday 27th February, 1986.

Portugal ) regulations
Romania )  relating thereto 20p
San Marino )
Spain )
Sweden )
Switzerland )
Turkey )
United Kingdom )
Union of Soviet )
Socialist Republics )
Vatican City State )
Yugodavia )
PART II.
COUNTRIESOUTSIDE EUROPE.
(8 Postal Packets-
First 10 Each Additional Air Letters
grammesor part 10 grammes or
thereof part thereof
Zonel 22p 22p
Zone 2 23p 22p
Zone3 25p 22p
Zone4 29p 22p
(b) For the purposes of Part 1, countries are zoned as follows:-
Country Zone Country Zone Country Zone
Abu Dhabi 2 Christmas 4 Iran 1
Island
Afghanistan 2 (Indian Irag 1
Ocean)
Ajman 2 Cocos (Keeling) 4 Israel 1
Is
Algeria 1 Colombia 3 Ivory Coast (Rep of) 2
Angola (People’s 2 Congo 2 Jamaica 3
Rep. Of) (People’s  Rep
of The)
Antigua 3 Costa Rica 3 Japan 3
Argentina 3 Cuba 3 Jordan 1
Ascension 2 Djbouti 2 Kenya 1
Country Zone Country Zone Country Zone
Austraia 4 Dominica 3 Kiribati (Rep of) 2
Bahamas 2 Dominican Rep 3 Korea 3

4



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No. 2,277, Thursday 27th February, 1986.

Bahrain (State of)
Bangladesh

Barbados

Belize
Benin (State of)

Bermuda

Bhutan

Bolivia

Botswana
Brazil

British Indian
Ocean Territory
British Virgin Is.
Brunei

Burundi
Cambodia
Cameroon
(United Rep of)
Canada
Caroline Islands

Cayman Islands
Central  African
Rep

Chad (Rep of)
Chile

China (People’s
Rep of)

Nauru Island
Nepal

Netherlands
Antilles
New Caledonia

New Hebrides

New Zealand
New Zedand Is
Territories
Nicaragua

N

N W

wWwN

Dubai
Ecuador

Egypt (Arab
Rep of)

El Salvador
Equatorial
Guinea
Ethiopia

Falkland Islands
&

Dependencies
Fiji

French Guiana
French
Polynesia

French W
Indies

Gabon (Rep of)
Gambia (Rep of
The)

Ghana

Grenada
Guatemala

Guinea (Rep of)
Guinea Bissau

Guyana
Haiti

Honduras Rep
Hong Kong
India

Indonesia
St Lucia
St Piere &
Miquelon
St Vincent

Samoa USA
Territory

Sao Tome &
Principe (Dem
Rep of)

Saudi Arabia
Senegal (Rep
of)

Seychelles

W ww

N W w

Kuwait

Lao People’s Dem
Rep

Lebanon

Lesotho
Liberia (Rep of)

Libyan Soc People’s
Arab - Jamahiriya
Macao

Madagascar (Dem
Rep)

Malawi

Malaysia (Inc
Malaya Sabah &
Sarawak)
Maldives (Rep of)

Mali
Mariana Islands

Marshall Islands
Mauritania
Mauritius
Mexico

Mongolia (People’s
Rep of)

Montserrat

Morocco

Mozambique

Tibet
Togo (Rep of)

Tonga

Trinidad & Tobago
Tunisia

Turks & Caicosls
Tuvalu

Uganda



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No. 2,277, Thursday 27th February, 1986.

Country

Nigeria (Fed Rep
of)

Niger Rep

Norfolk Island

Oman (Sultanate
of)

Pakistan

Panama (Rep of)

Papua New
Guinea

Paraguay

Peru

Philippines

Pitcairn Isand
Puerto Rico
Qatar (State of)
Reunion
Rwanda

St Helena
St KittsNevis-
Anguilla

Zone
2

2

4

NWwWNN D wwh

AN

Country
SierraLeone

Singapore (Rep
of)
Solomon
Islands
Somali
Rep
South Africa
Spanish
Territories  of
North Africa
(Ceuta
Chafarinas Jadu
& Médlilla)

Sri Lanka

Dem

Sudan Dem Rep
Surinam
Swaziland

Sri Lanka
Sudan Dem Rep
Surinam
Swaziland
Syrian
Rep
Taiwan
Tanzania

Arab

Thailand

Replacement of Schedule 3.

10. The principal regulations are further amended by revoking Schedule 3

Zone
2

3

4

P WwWwNhw W wN

N W

Country
United
Emirates
United States of
America

Uruguay

Arab

Venezuela

Vietnam
Virgin Is of USA

Wake Island

Western Samoa
Yemen (Arab Rep)
Yemen (People’s
Dem Rep of)

Zaire (Rep of)
Zambia

Zimbabwe

thereof, and subgtituting therefor the following new Schedule:

"SCHEDULE 3.

PART I.

Zone
2

2

4

Regulations 6 and 7.

RATES OF POSTAGE PAYABLE.

PRINTED PACKETS.



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No. 2,277, Thursday 27th February, 1986.

Weight not over Full rate of Postage Reduced rate of
Postage
20 grammes 10p 9p
Weight not over Full rate of Postage Reduced rate of
Postage
100 grammes 21p 18p
250 grammes 38p 33p
500 grammes 66p 57p
1000 grammes £1.10p 95p
2000 grammes £1.54p £1.32p
3000 grammes £2.31p £1.98p
4000 grammes £3.08p £2.63p
5000 grammes £3.85p £3.31p
PART II.

SMALL PACKETS.

Weight not over Rate of postage
100 grammes 20p
250 grammes 37p
500 grammes 66p
1000 grammes £1.10p

Replacement of Schedule 5.

11. The principal regulations are further amended by revoking Schedule 5
thereof, and subgtituting therefor the following new Schedule:

"SCHEDULE 5.

Regulations 33 and 34

COMPENSATION.

Compensation Fee Maximum Compensation
50p £100
£1.00 £200
£1.50 £300
£2.00 £400
£2.50 £500



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No. 2,277, Thursday 27th February, 1986.

£3.00 £600

£3.50 £700
Compensation Fee Maximum Compensation

£4.00 £800

£4.50 £900

£5.00 £1000

Dated this 27th day of February, 1986.

By Command,
J. K. E. BROADLEY,
Deputy Governor.



