
SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR 

GAZETTE 
 

No. 5221    GIBRALTAR   Thursday 10th April 2025 

 

 

LEGAL NOTICE NO. 80 OF 2025 

 

PORT ACT 

 

PORT (AMENDMENT) RULES 2025 

 

In exercise of the powers conferred on her by section 19 of the Port Act, the Minister has made 

the following Rules- 
 

Title. 

 

1.  These Rules may be cited as the Port (Amendment) Rules 2025. 

 

Commencement. 

 

2.  These Rules come into operation on 1st May 2025. 

 

Amendment to the Port Rules. 

 

3.(1)  Schedule 4 to the Port Rules is amended in accordance with this rule. 

 

  (2)  For paragraph 1(a) substitute –  

 

“1. Tonnage dues. 

 

(a) Subject to subparagraphs (b), (bb), (c) and (d), the following tonnage dues shall be 

payable by all vessels except passenger vessels, arriving at, touching at, or having 

communication with Gibraltar, or the anchorage, port or harbour thereof in respect 

of each period of forty eight hours or part thereof that a vessel remains at Gibraltar 

–  

 

 

GRT          £ 
 

Vessels up to 1,000 GRT     46.20  

Vessels 1,001 GRT and up to 5,000    90.20  

Vessels 5,001 GRT and up to 10,000    203.50  

Vessels 10,001 GRT and up to 15,000    250.80  

Vessels 15,001 GRT and up to 30,000   492.80  

Vessels 30,001 GRT and up to 50,000    927.30 

Vessels 50,001 GRT and up to 70,000    1,680.80  

Vessels 70,001 GRT and up to 100,000    2,013.00  

Vessels 100,001 GRT and up to 150,000   2,250.00  

Vessels greater than 150,001 GRT   3,000.00”. 



 

Gibraltar Gazette, No. 5221, Thursday 10th April 2025 

 

 2

 

  (3)  For paragraph 1(b) substitute – 

 

“(b) The tonnage dues set out in subparagraph (a) include any costs involved in 

connection with the provision of port security.” 

 

  (4)  After paragraph 1(b) insert –  

 

“(bb) In addition to the tonnage fees set out in subparagraph (a), the charges set by 

the Minister with responsibility for the Port and Shipping for the purpose of 

regulation 14 of the Gibraltar Merchant Shipping (Port Waste Reception Facilities) 

Regulations 2002 are payable by all vessels, arriving at, touching at or having 

communication with Gibraltar, or its anchorage, port or harbour;”. 

 

  (5)  For paragraph 2 substitute –  

 

“2. Passenger ships: tonnage dues. 

 

The following tonnage dues shall be payable by all passenger vessels arriving or 

touching at Gibraltar or the anchorage, port or harbour –  

 

GRT            £  
 

Vessels up to 10 GRT      16.50  

Vessels 10 GRT and up to 50     19.25  

Vessels 50 GRT and up to 200    24.75  

Vessels 200 GRT and up to 1,000    35.75  

Vessels 1,000 GRT and up to 1,500    44.00  

Vessels 1,500 GRT and up to 2,000    52.25  

Vessels 2,000 GRT and up to 5,000    82.50  

Vessels 5,000 GRT and up to 7,000    88.00  

Vessels 7,000 GRT and up to 10,000    96.25  

Vessels 10,000 GRT and up to 15,000   99.00  

Vessels 15,000 GRT and up to 20,000   107.25  

Vessels 20,000 GRT and up to 30,000   115.50  

Vessels 30,000 GRT and up to 40,000   123.75 

Vessels 40,000 GRT and up to 50,000   132.00  

Vessels 50,000 GRT and up to 70,000   148.50  

Vessels 70,000 GRT and up to 100,000   165.00  

Vessels greater than 100,000 GRT    220.00”; 

 

  (6)  For paragraph 4 substitute- 

 

“4. Non-touching Tonnage Dues (Off Port Limit A and B)  

 

Operations which do not require the vessel to anchor or touch upon Gibraltar are 

charged at the rate of £250.00.”  

 



 

Gibraltar Gazette, No. 5221, Thursday 10th April 2025 

 

 3

  (7)  In paragraph 5 (berthing charges) – 

 

(a) in subparagraph (a) for “6p” substitute “9p”; 

 

(b) in subparagraph (b) for “8p” substitute “11p”; 

 

(c) in subparagraph (c) for “8p” substitute “11p”; 

 

(d)  in subparagraph (d) for “5p” substitute “7p”; 

 

(e) in subparagraph (e) for “11p” substitute “16p”; 

 

(f) in subparagraph (f) for “3p” substitute “4p”; 

 

(g) in subparagraph (h) for “6p” substitute “9p”; 

 

(h) in subparagraph (j) for “8p” substitute “11p”; 

 

(i) in subparagraph (k) for “3p” substitute “4p”; 

 

(j) in subparagraph (l) for “6p” substitute “9p”; 

 

(k) in subparagraph (m) for “8p” substitute “11p”; 

 

(l) in the text below subparagraph (m) for “£5” substitute “£7.17”. 

 

  (8)  In paragraph 10 (bunkering charges)- 

  

(a) for “£0.20” substitute “£0.30”; 

 

(b) for the text below “Tonnage transferred” substitute –  

 

                        “Less than 50,000 metric tonnes   £7,500 

   50,001-100,000 metric tonnes   £11,000  

   100,001-150,000 metric tonnes   £15,000  

   150,001-200,000 metric tonnes   £22,500”; 

 

(c) in subparagraph (c), for “In additional” substitute “In addition”.  

    

  (9)  In paragraph 14 (Super Yacht Tariff Card) for “£5/m” substitute “£6.50/m”.   

 

Dated: 10th April 2025 

 

 

 

G ARIAS VASQUEZ 

Minister with responsibility for Business, Tourism and the Port 

For the Government 



 

Gibraltar Gazette, No. 5221, Thursday 10th April 2025 

 

 4

 

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM 

 

These Rules amend Schedule 4 of the Port Rules. 

 


