
SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR
GAZETTE

No. 2,482 of  9th March, 1989.

LEGAL NOTICE No. 22 OF 1989.

PATENTS ACT.

PATENTS (AMENDMENT) RULES, 1989.

In exercise of the powers conferred on him by section 11 of the Patents Act,
and of all other enabling powers, the Registrar of Patents with approval of
the Governor has made the following rules

Title and commencement.

1. These rules may be cited as the Patents (Amendment) Rules 1989 and
shall come into operation on 1st April 1989.

Amendment of Rule 6.

2. Rule 6 of the Patents Rules is amended as follows - (a) in sub-rule (1) by
substituting "£30" for "£20"; (b) in sub-rule (2) by substituting "£8" far "£5";
(c) in sub-rule (3) by substituting "£IS" for "£10"; (d) in sub-rule (5) by
substituting "£5" far "£3". Dated this 9th day of March, 1989.

M. BALBAN,

Registrar of Patents.


