SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR
GAZETTE

No. 4566 of 11 April, 2019

LEGAL NOTICE NO. 091 OF 2019

NATURE PROTECTION ACT 1991

NATURE PROTECTION (UPPER ROCK NATURE RESERVE FEES)
REGULATIONS 2019

In exercise of the powers conferred on him by section 23 of the Nature Protection Act 1991,
the Minister has made the following Regul ations-

Title.

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Nature Protection (Upper Rock Nature Reserve
Fees) Regulations 2019.

Commencement.
2. These Regulations come into operation on the day of publication.
Amendment of the Nature Protection Act 1991.
3.(1) The Nature Protection Act 1991 is amended in accordance with this regulation.
(2) In Schedule 10—
(@ inparagraph 1(1)-
(1) in subparagraph (b) for “£12.00” substitute “£13.00”;
(i) in subparagraph (c) for “£7.00” substitute “£8.00”;
(iii) in subparagraph (d) for “£7.00” substitute “£8.00”;
(iv) in subparagraph (e) for “£12.00” substitute “£13.00”;
(v) in subparagraph (f)—
(aa) for “£7.00” substitute “£8.00”;
(bb) for “;” substitute “.”;

(vi)  delete subparagraph (g).



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No. 4566 of Thursday 11 April, 2019

(b) in paragraph 1(2)-
(1) in subparagraph (a) for “£7.00” substitute “£8.00”;
(i) in subparagraph (b) for “£2.00” substitute “£3.00”.

Dated 11th April, 2019.

DR JCORTES,
Minister with responsibility for the Environment.

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM

These Regulations amend the fees set out in Schedule 10 of the Nature Protection Act 1991.

818



