
SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR 

GAZETTE  
No.  2,552 17th MAY, 1990. 

 

 

 

LEGAL NOTICE NO. 50 OF 1990. 

 

MERCHANT SHIPPING ACT. 

 

PILOTS (AMENDMENT) RULES, 1990. 

 

In exercise of the powers conferred upon him by Sections 181 and 188(6) of 

the Merchant Shipping Act, and of all other enabling powers, the Governor 

has made the following rules--- 

 

Title. 

 

1. These rules may be cited as the Pilots (Amendment) Rules 1990. 

 

Amendment to rule 3. 

 

2. Rule 3 of the Pilots Rules (hereinafter called "the principal rules") is 

amended in paragraph (a) by inserting after the word "subject" the words "or 

a national of a Member State of the European Communities". 

 

Amendment to rule 6. 

 

3. The principal rules are amended in rule 6 by omitting the figure "£2" and 

substituting therefor the figure "£50". 

 

Amendment to rule 7. 

 

4. The principal rules are amended in rule 7 by omitting in sub-rule (3) the 

word "Governor" and substituting therefor the words "Captain of the Port". 

 

Amendment to rule 8. 

 

5. The principal rules are further amended in rule 8 by omitting the word 

"Governor" and substituting therefor the words "Captain of the Port". 

 

 

 

Amendment to rule 9. 

 



L.N. 50/90]   GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No. 2,552, Thursday 17th May, 

1990. 

 

  

6. Rule 9 of the principal rules is amended by omitting the figure "£ 1 " and 

substituting therefor the figure therefor the figure "110". 

 

Amendment to rule 10. 

 

7. Rule 10 of the principal rules is amended in sub-rules (1) and (2) by 

omitting the word "Governor" wherever it appears and substituting therefor 

the words "Captain of the Port". 

 

Amendment to rule 14. 

 

8: Rule 14 of the principal rules is amended by omitting sub-rule (1) and 

substituting therefor the following new sub-rule— 

 

 "(1) Pilots shall provide to the Captain of the Port a roster of 

attendance at the Boarding Station daily from 6 o'clock in the 

forenoon till 6 o'clock in the afternoon such as to provide the 

level of attendance required by the Captain of the Port and to 

provide that one pilot will be on duty from 6 o'clock in the 

afternoon to 6 o'clock in the forenoon.". 

 

Amendment to rule 16. 

 

9. Rule 16 of the principal rules is amended by omitting the figure "£5" and 

substituting therefor the figure "£ 100". 

 

Amendment to rule 19. 

 

10. Rule 19 of the principal rules is amended by omitting sub-rule (1) and 

substituting therefor the following new sub-rule 

 

 "(1) The fees to be paid to licensed pilots by the persons liable 

under the provisions of this Act so to pay, shall be those 

agreed with the Captain of the Port and specified by him by 

notice in the Gazette.". 

 

 

 

Revocation of Schedule 4. 

 

11. Schedule 4 of the principal rules is revoked. Dated this 17th day of May, 

1990. 



L.N. 50/90]   GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No. 2,552, Thursday 17th May, 

1990. 

 

  

 

By Command, 

 

W. E. QUANTRILL, 

 

Deputy Governor. 


