
SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR 

GAZETTE 
 

No. 5163    GIBRALTAR   Thursday 18th July 2024 

 

 

LEGAL NOTICE NO. 119 OF 2024 

 

MARKETS, STREET TRADERS AND PEDLARS ACT 

 

STREET TRADERS AND PEDLARS (AMENDMENT) RULES 2024 

 

In exercise of the powers conferred on her by section 15 of the Markets, Street Traders and 

Pedlars Act, the Minister has made the following Rules–  

 

Title.  
 

1.  These Rules may be cited as the Street Traders and Pedlars (Amendment) Rules 2024.  

 

Commencement. 
 

2.  These Rules come into operation on 1 August 2024. 

 

Amendment to rules. 

 

3.  The Street Traders and Pedlars Rules are amended as follows- 

 

(a) in rule 6A(4) for “£23” substitute “£23.50”; 

 

(b) in rule 7 for “£11.50” substitute “£12”; 

 

(c) in the Schedule, for “£23” substitute “£23.50” in each place it appears. 

 

 

Dated: 18th July 2024. 

 

 

 

 

 

G ARIAS VASQUEZ, 

Minister with responsibility for Business. 

 

 


