
SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR 

GAZETTE 
 

No. 4981    GIBRALTAR   Thursday 4th August 2022 

 

 

LEGAL NOTICE NO. 226 OF 2022 

 

MARKETS, STREET TRADERS AND PEDLARS ACT 

 

STREET TRADERS AND PEDLARS (AMENDMENT) RULES 2022 

 

In exercise of the powers conferred on him by section 15 of the Markets, Street Traders and 

Pedlars Act the Minister has made the following Rules–  

 

Title.  

 

1.  These Rules may be cited as the Street Traders and Pedlars (Amendment) Rules 2022.  

 

Commencement. 

 

2.  These Rules come into operation on the day of publication. 

 

Amendment to rules. 

 

3.  The Street Traders and Pedlars Rules are amended as follows- 

 

(a) in rule 6A(4) for “£20” substitute “£21.50”; 

 

(b) in rule 7 for “£10” substitute “£11”; 

 

(c) in the Schedule, for “£20” substitute “£21.50” on each occasion that sum appears. 

 

 

Dated: 4th August 2022. 

 

 

V DARYANANI, 

Minister with responsibility for Business and Commercial Affairs. 

 

_____________________________________________ 

 

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM 

 

These Rules revise the fees in line with the 2022 Budget Statement. 
 

 

 

 

 


