
SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR 

GAZETTE 
No. 4003 of 23 May, 2013 

 

 
 

LEGAL NOTICE NO. 78 OF 2013. 

 

LITTER CONTROL ACT, 1990 (AMENDMENT)  

REGULATIONS 2013 

 

In exercise of the powers conferred upon it by section 4 of the Litter Control 

Act, 1990 the Government has made the following Regulations− 

 

Title and commencement. 

 
1.  These Regulations may be cited as the Litter Control Act, 1990 

(Amendment) Regulations 2013 and come into operation on the day of 

publication. 

 

Amendment of Litter Control Act. 

 

2.  The Litter Control Act, 1990 is amended as follows− 

 

(a) in Schedule 1 after the entry “Persons appointed under section 

87 of the Traffic Act” insert “The Principal Secretary of the 

Department of the Environment”; 

 
(b) in paragraph 3 of Schedule 2− 

 

 (i) in subparagraph (a) for “£150” substitute “£250”; and 

 

 (ii) in subparagraph (b) for “£30” substitute “£70”. 

 

Dated 23rd May, 2013. 

 

 

 

 
 

 

DR JOHN CORTES, 

Minister with responsibility for the Environment, 

For the Government. 

  



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 4003, Thursday 23 May, 2013 

 

 608 

____________ 

 

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM 

 

These Regulations amend the Litter Control Act by inserting a new litter 

authority in Schedule 1 and by amending Schedule 2 as regards sums 

payable for fixed penalty notices issued under section 6 of the Act. 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

 

 

 

  



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 4003, Thursday 23 May, 2013 

 

 609 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

Printed by the Gibraltar Chronicle Printing Limited 

Unit 3, New Harbours 

Government Printers for Gibraltar, 

Copies may be purchased at 6, Convent Place, Price £0.30p 

 

 


