
SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR 

GAZETTE 
 

No. 5263    GIBRALTAR   Thursday 30th October 2025 

 

 

LEGAL NOTICE NO. 255 OF 2025 

 

IMPORTS AND EXPORTS ACT, 1986   

 

INTEGRATED TARIFF (AMENDMENT No. 2) REGULATIONS 2025  

 

In exercise of the powers conferred upon it by sections 45 and 129 of the Imports and Exports, 

Act 1986, and all other enabling powers, the Government has made the following Regulations– 

 

Title. 

 

1.  These Regulations may be cited as the Integrated Tariff (Amendment No. 2) Regulations 

2025. 

 

Commencement.  

 

2.  These Regulations come into operation on the day of publication.  

 

Amendment to Chapter 24 of the Integrated Tariff Regulations 2017.  

 

3.  Chapter 24 of Schedule 1 to the Integrated Tariff Regulations 2017 is amended as follows- 

 

(a) in the entry marked “2402 20 10” for “£114.50/1000” substitute “£121/1000”; 

 

(b) in the entry marked “2402 20 90” for “£114.50/1000” substitute “£121/1000”. 
 

Amendment to Chapter 98 of the Integrated Tariff Regulations 2017.  

 

4.  In Chapter 98 of Schedule 1 to the Integrated Tariff Regulations 2017 in the entry marked 

“9824 02 20” for “£114.50/1000” substitute “£121/1000”. 
 

Amendment to Chapter 99 of the Integrated Tariff Regulations 2017.  

 

5.  In Chapter 99 of Schedule 1 to the Integrated Tariff Regulations 2017 in the entry marked 

“9907 00 00” for “£114.50/1000” substitute “£121/1000”. 

 

Dated: 30th October 2025. 

 

F R PICARDO, 

Chief Minister, 

For the Government. 

 

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM  

These Regulations amend the Integrated Tariff Regulations 2017.   


