
SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR 

GAZETTE 
 

No. 5245    GIBRALTAR   Thursday 31st July 2025 

 

 

LEGAL NOTICE NO. 171 OF 2025 

 

 

IMPORTS AND EXPORTS ACT, 1986 

 

IMPORTS AND EXPORTS (BONDED STORES AND TRANSIT SHEDS) 

(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2025 

 

In exercise of the powers conferred upon it by section 129 of the Imports and Exports Act, 

1986, the Government has made the following Regulations– 

 

Title. 

 

1.  These Regulations may be cited as the Imports and Exports (Bonded Stores and Transit 

Sheds) (Amendment) Regulations 2025. 

 

Commencement. 

 

2.  These Regulations come into operation on 1 August 2025. 

 

Amendment to the Imports and Exports (Bonded Stores and Transit Sheds) Regulations 

2005. 

 

3.(1)  The Imports and Exports (Bonded Stores and Transit Sheds) Regulations 2005 are 

amended in accordance with this regulation.  

 

  (2)  In regulation 3(4)–  

 

(a) in paragraph (a) for “£881.50” substitute “£908.00”;  

 

(b) in paragraph (b) for “£1763.50” substitute “£1816.50”.  

 

Dated: 31st July 2025. 

 

 

 

 

F R PICARDO, 

 for the Government.   
 

 

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM 

 

These Regulations revise the fees payable in line with the 2025 Budget Statement. 


