
SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR 

GAZETTE 
 

No. 5170    GIBRALTAR   Thursday 5th September 2024 

 

 

LEGAL NOTICE NO.174 OF 2024 

 

 

GIBRALTAR PILOTAGE ACT 2016 

 

GIBRALTAR PILOTAGE (AMENDMENT NO. 2) REGULATIONS 2024 
 

In exercise of the powers conferred on her by section 30 of the Gibraltar Pilotage Act 2016, 

the Minister has made the following Regulations - 
 

Title. 

 
1.  These Regulations may be cited as the Gibraltar Pilotage (Amendment No.2) Regulations 

2024. 

 

Commencement. 

 

2.  These Regulations come into operation on 1 October 2024. 

 

Amendments to Gibraltar Pilotage Regulations 2016. 

 

3.(1)  The Gibraltar Pilotage Regulations 2016 are amended in accordance with this 

regulation. 

 

  (2)  In regulation 5(2)(b) for “£10” substitute “£11.50”. 

 

  (3)  In regulation 6(2)(b) for “£100” substitute “£117.00”. 

 

  (4)  In regulation 7(7) for “£50” substitute “£64.00”. 

 

  (5)  In regulation 13 for “£50” substitute “£64.00”. 

 

  (6)  In regulation 19 – 

 

(a) in subsection (1) for “£100.00” substitute “£117.00”; 

 

(b) in subsection (3) for “£100.00” substitute “£117.00”. 

 

  (7)  In regulation 31 for “£100.00” substitute “£117.00”. 

 

  (8)  In Schedule 4 for “£100.00” substitute “£117.00”. 

 

  (9)  In Schedule 5 for “£100.00” substitute “117.00”. 

 



 

Gibraltar Gazette, No. 5170, Thursday 5th September 2024 

 

 2

 

Dated: 5th September  

 

G ARIAS VASQUEZ, 

Minister with responsibility for the Port. 
 

 

__________________________________________ 

 

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM 

 

These Regulations amend fees in the Gibraltar Pilotage Regulations 2016.  
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 


