
FIRST SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR  

GAZETTE 

No. 2,366 of 16th JULY, 1987. 
 

I ASSENT, 

PETER TERRY  

GOVERNOR.  

16th July, 1987. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

GIBRALTAR 

 

No. 19 of 1987. 

 

AN ORDINANCE to amend the Firearms Ordinance. 

 

ENACTED by the Legislature of Gibraltar. 

 
Title. 

 
1. This Ordinance may be cited as the Firearms (Amendment) Ordinance, 

1987. 

 
Amendment to Ordinance. 



 Firearms (Amendment) Ordinance, 1987 

 

 34

 
2. The Firearms Ordinance is amended- 

 
(a) in section 5(1)(a) by omitting- the expression "£3" and 

substituting therefor the expression "£5"; 

 

(b) in section 5(1)(b) sad (c) by omitting the expression "£2” and 

substituting therefor the expression "£3"; 

 

(c) in section 10(2) by omitting the expression "£30" and 

substituting therefor the expression  “£40". 

 
Passed by the Gibraltar House of Assembly an the 7th day of July, 1987. 

 

P. A. GARBARINO  

Clerk to the Assembly. 


