
SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR 

GAZETTE 
No. 2,789 of 14th July, 1994. 

 

 

LEGAL NOTICE No. 63 OF 1994. 

 

FACTORIES ORDINANCE. 

 

FACTORIES (ELECTRICITY) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 

1994. 

 

In exercise of the powers conferred on him by section 58 of the Factories 

Ordinance, and of all other enabling powers, the Governor has made the 

following regulations - 

 

Title and commencement. 

 

1. These regulations may be cited as the Factories (Electricity) (Amendment) 

Regulations 1994 and shall come into effect on the lst day of August, 1994. 

 

Amendment to regulation 22. 

 

2. Regulation 22 of the Factories (Electricity) Regulations (hereinafter called 

"the principal Regulations") is amended in sub-regulation (2) - 

 

(a) in paragraph (a) by - 

 

  (i) omitting the expression "7 feet" and substituting 

therefor the expression "2150mm"; 

 

  (ii) omitting the expression "3 feet" and substituting 

therefor the expression "915mm"; 

 

(b) in paragraph (b) by - 

 

  (i) omitting the expression "8 feet" and substituting 

therefor the expression "2440mm"; 

 

  (ii) omitting the expression "3 feet 6 inches" and 

substituting therefor the expression "1070mm"; 

 

(c) in paragraph (c) (i) by - 

 



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No. 2,789, Thursday 14th July, 1994. 

 

 2

  (i) omitting the expression "4 feet 6 inches" and 

substituting therefor the expression "1370mm"; 

 

  (ii) omitting the expression "8 feet" and substituting 

therefor the expression "2440mm". 

 

Amendment to regulation 33. 

 

3. Regulation 33 of the principal Regulations is amended in sub-regulation 

(1)- 

 

(a) by omitting the words "of Labour & Social Security"; 

 

(b) by omitting the figure "21" and substituting therefor the figure 

“18”. 

 

Amendment to regulation 34. 

 

4. Regulation 34 of the principal Regulations is amended by - 

 

(a) omitting the words "of Labour & Social Security"; 

 

(b) omitting the word "Spanish" and substituting therefor the 

words "such other language or languages as the Director may 

direct". 

 

Dated this 14th day of July, 1994. 

 

By command,  

 

A. CARTER,  

 

Deputy Governor. 


