
SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR 
GAZETTE 

No. 3,009 of 20th November, 1997 
 
LEGAL NOTICE NO. 142 OF 1997 
 
 

EDUCATION ORDINANCE 
 

EDUCATIONAL AWARDS (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 
1997 

 
 
In exercise of the powers conferred on him by section 82 of the Education 
Ordinance and section 24 of the Interpretation and General Clauses 
Ordinance, and of all other enabling powers, the Governor has made the 
following regulations – 
 
Title and Commencement. 
 
1.  These regulations which may be cited as the Educational Awards 
(Amendment) Regulations 1997 shall be read as one with the Educational 
Awards Regulations 1990, as amended (a), (hereinafter referred to as the 
“principal Regulations”) and shall come into effect on the 1st day of 
September 1997. 
 
Amendment to regulation 15 of the principal Regulations. 
 
2.  In regulation 15(1) of the principal Regulations (awards) – 
 

(a) for the sum “£1188”, there shall be substituted “£1233”; and 
 
(b) for the sum “£630”, there shall be substituted “£653”. 

 
 
 
_____________________________________________________________
_ 
 
(a)  The last relevant amendments were the Education Awards (Amendment) 
Regulations 1992 (Legal Notice No. 106 of 1992) and the Education Awards 
(Amendment) Regulations 1994 (Legal Notice No. 89 of 1994). 



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 3,009, Thursday 20th November, 1997 
 

 708

Amendment to Schedule 2 of the principal Regulations (Statutory 
Requirements). 
 
3.(1)  At Part I of Schedule 2 to the principal Regulations (ordinary 
maintenance) – 
 

(a) in paragraph 1, for the rate “£3430”, there shall be substituted 
“£3636”; and 

 
(b)  in paragraph 2, for the rate “£2790”, there shall be substituted 

“£2957”. 
 

 (2)  At Part 2 of Schedule 2 (supplementary and miscellaneous 
maintenance)-  
 

(a)  in paragraph 1(1)(a), for the sum “£69.25”, there shall be 
substituted “£86.10p”; 

 
(b)  in paragraph 1(1)(b), for the sum “£51.86”, there shall be 

substituted “£64.55”; 
 
(c)  in paragraph 4, for the sum “£45.65”, there shall be substituted 

“£47.36”; 
 
(d)  in paragraph 5, for the sum “£805”, there shall be substituted 

“£835”; 
 
(e)  in paragraph 7, for the expenditure “£161”, there shall be 

substituted “£167”; 
 
(f)   in paragraph 8(a), for the rate “£4309”, there shall be 

substituted “£4569”; 
 
(g) in paragraph 8(b), for the rate “£3799”, there shall be substituted 

“£4028”; 
 
(h)  in paragraph 8(c), for the rate “£3292”, there shall be 

substituted “£3486”; and 
 
(i)  in paragraph 8(d), for the rate “£2790”, there shall be substituted 

“£2957”. 



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 3,009, Thursday 20th November, 1997 
 

 709

Amendment to Schedule 3 of the principal Regulations (Resources). 
 
4.(1)  In sub-paragraphs 2(1) and (2) of Part 2 of Schedule 3 (parental 
contributions), for the reference to “£5000”, there shall be substituted 
“£6000”. 
 
(2)  In Part (3) of Schedule 3 (income of spouse) for the reference to 
“£5000”, there shall be substituted “£6000”.  
 
 
Dated this 20th day of November, 1997.    

 
By Command, 

 
M J ROBINSON, 

 
Deputy Governor. 



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 3,009, Thursday 20th November, 1997 
 

 710

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM 
 

These Regulations amend the Educational Awards Regulations 1990 by 
increasing the amounts of awards payable under the 1990 Regulations and 
also raising the ceiling for the purposes of assessing parental contributions. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Printed by the Gibraltar Chronicle Limited 
Printing Office, 2, Library Gardens, 
Government Printers for Gibraltar, 



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 3,009, Thursday 20th November, 1997 
 

 711

Copies may be purchased at 6, Convent Place, Price 40p. 
 


