
SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR 

GAZETTE 
No. 2,796 of lst September, 1994. 

 

 

LEGAL NOTICE NO. 89 OF 1994. 

 

EDUCATION ORDINANCE. 

 

EDUCATIONAL AWARDS (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS, 1994. 

 

In exercise of the powers conferred on him by section 82 of the Education 

Ordinance, and of all other enabling powers, the Governor has made the 

following regulations – 

 

Title and commencement. 

 

1. These regulations may be cited as the Educational Awards (Amendment) 

Regulations 1994 and shall come into effect on the 1 st day of September, 

1994. 

 

Amendment to regulation 15. 

 

2. Regulation 15 of the Educational Awards Regulations 1990 (hereinafter 

called "the principal Regulations") is amended in subregulation (1) by - 

 

(a) omitting the figure "£1186" and substituting therefor the figure 

"£1188' ; 

 

(b) omitting the figure "£627" and substituting therefor the figure 

"£630". 

 

Amendment to Schedule 2. 

 

3. Schedule 2 to the principal Regulations is amended - 

 

(a) in Part 1 by - 

 

  (i)  omitting in paragraph 1 the figure "£3422" and 

substituting therefor the figure "£3430"; 

 

  (ii) omitting in paragraph 2 the figure "£2783" and 

substituting therefor the figure '£2790"; 

 



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No. 2,796, Thursday 1st September, 1994. 

 

 2

(b) in Part II by- 

 

  (i)  omitting in paragraph 8 (a) the figure "£4300" and 

substituting therefor the figure “£4309"; 

 

  (ii) omitting in paragraph 8(b) the figure "£3789" and 

substituting therefor the figure "£3799"; 

 

  (iii) omitting in paragraph 8(c) the figure "£3285" and 

substituting therefor the figure "£3292"; 

 

  (iv) omitting in paragraph 8(d) the figure "£2783" and 

substituting therefor the figure "£2790". 

 

Dated this 1 st day of September, 1994. 

 

By Command, 

 

A. CARTER, 

 

Deputy Governor. 

 


