SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR

GAZETTE
No. 2,682, of 30th July, 1992.

LEGAL NOTICE NO. 106 OF 1992.
EDUCATION ORDINANCE

EDUCATIONAL AWARDS (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 1992
In exercise of the powers conferred on him by section 82 of the Education
Ordinance, and of all other enabling powers, the Governor has made the
following regulations-
Title and commencement.
1. These regulations may be cited as the Educational Awards (Amendment)
Regulations 1992 and shall come into effect on the 1st day of September
1992.

Amendment to regulation 15.

2. Regulation 15 of the Educational Awards Regulations 1990 (hereinafter
called "the principal Regulations") is amended in subregulation (1) by-

(@) omitting the figure "£1046" and substituting therefor the
figure "£1122";

(b) omitting the figure "£553" and substituting therefor the figure
"£593".

Amendment to Schedule 2.
3. Schedule 2 to the principal Regulations is amended-
(@) inPartlby-

(i) omitting in paragraph 1 the figure "£3017" and
substituting therefor the figure "£3237";

(ii) omitting in paragraph 2 the figure "£2454" and
substituting therefor the figure "£2633";



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No. 2,682, Thursday 30th July, 1992.

(b) inPartll by-

(i) omitting in paragraph 1(1)(a) the figure "£64.54"
and substituting therefor the figure "£b9.25";

(ii) omitting in paragraph 1(1)(b) the figure "£48.33"
and substituting therefor the figure $51.86";

(iii) omitting in paragraph 4 the figure "£42.54" and
substituting therefor the figure "£45.65";

(iv) omitting in paragraph 5 the figure "£750" and
substituting -therefor the figure "£805";

(v) omitting in paragraph 7 the figure "£150" and
substituting therefor the figure "£161";

(vi) omitting in paragraph 8 (a) the figure "£3791"
and substituting therefor the figure "£4068";

(vii) omitting in paragraph 8 (b) the figure "£3341"
and substituting therefor the figure "£3585";

(viii) omitting in paragraph 8 (c) the figure "£2897"
and substituting therefor the figure "£3108";

(ix) omitting in paragraph 8 (d) the figure "£2454"
and substituting therefor the figure "£2633".

Dated this 30th day of July, 1992.
By Command,

E. MONTADO,
Acting Deputy Governor.



