SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR
GAZETTE

No.5076 GIBRALTAR Tuesday 1st August 2023

LEGAL NOTICE NO. 237 OF 2023

COMPETITION ACT 2020

COMPETITION (MERGER FEES)(AMENDMENT) ORDER 2023
In exercise of the powers conferred on him by section 183 of the Competition Act 2020, and
all other enabling powers, the Minister has made the following Order-
Title.
1. This Order may be cited as the Competition (Merger Fees)(Amendment) Order 2023.
Commencement.
2. This Order comes into operation on 1 August 2023.

Amendment of the Competition (Merger Fees and Determination of Turnover) Order
2021.

3. Article 6(1) of the Competition (Merger Fees and Determination of Turnover) Order 2021
is amended as follows —

(a) in paragraph (a) for “£5,000” substitute “£5,310”;
(b) in paragraph (b) for “£10,000” substitute “£10,620”;

(c) in paragraph (c) for “£15,000” substitute “£15,930”.

Dated: 1% August 2023.

V DARYANANI,
Minister with responsibility for Business.



Gibraltar Gazette, No. 5076, Tuesday 1st August 2023

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM

This Order amends the Competition (Merger Fees and Determination of Turnover) Order
2021.



