
SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR
GAZETTE

No. 4908 GIBRALTAR Thursday 21st October 2021

LEGAL NOTICE NO. 429 OF 2021

COMPANIES ACT 2014

COMPANIES ACT (FEES) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2021

In exercise of the powers conferred upon him by section 426 of the Companies Act 2014,
and all other enabling powers, the Minister has made the following Regulations-

Title.

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Companies Act (Fees) (Amendment) Regulations
2021.

Commencement.

2.  These Regulations shall come into operation on 1st January 2022.

Amendment of the fees in section 426 of the Companies Act 2014.

3.  Section 426(4) of the Companies Act 2014 is amended as follows-

(a) in paragraph (a)-

(i) in subparagraph (i) for “£36.50” substitute “£40.00”;

(ii) in subparagraph (ii) for “£71.50” substitute “£80.00”;

(iii) in subparagraph (iii) for “£106.50” substitute “£120.00”;

(iv) in subparagraph (iv) for “£141.50” substitute “£160.00”;

(b) in paragraph (b)-

(i) in subparagraph (i) for “£58.50” substitute “£100.00”;

(ii) in subparagraph (ii) for “£117.00” substitute “£150.00”; and

(c) in paragraph (c) for “£17.50” substitute “£20.00”.

Amendment of Schedule 24 to the Companies Act 2014.

4.  Schedule 24 to the Companies Act 2014 is amended as follows-



Gibraltar Gazette, No. 4908, Thursday 21st October 2021

2

(a) in paragraph 1(c) for “£585.00” substitute “£620.00”;

(b) in paragraph 1(d) for “£200.00” substitute “£210.00”;

(c) in paragraph 1(g)-

(i) for “£86.00” substitute “£91.00” in the two places where it occurs;

(ii) for “£150.00” substitute “£160.00”;

(iii) for “£250.00” substitute “£265.00”;

(iv) for “£500.00” substitute “£525.00”;

(v) for “£117.00” substitute “£200.00”;

(d) in paragraph 1(h) for “£17.50” substitute “£20.00”

(e) in paragraph 1(i) for “£17.50” substitute “£20.00”;

(f) in paragraph 1(j) –

(i) for “£105.00” substitute “£110.00”;

(ii) for “£58.50” substitute “£62.00”;

(g) in paragraph 1(k) for “£17.50” substitute “£25.00”;

(h) in paragraph 1(l) for “£87.75” substitute “£92.00”;

(i) in paragraph 1(m) for “£35.00” substitute “£37.00”;

(j) in paragraph 1(p) for “£52.50” substitute “£55.00”;

(k) in paragraph 1(q)-

(i) for “£17.50” substitute “£20.00” in both places where it occurs;

(ii) for “£23.50” substitute “£25.00”;

(iii) in subparagraphs (ii)(dd) and (ee) for “£50.00” substitute “£55.00”;

(iv) in subparagraph (ii)(ff) for “£75.00” substitute “£80.00”; and

(l) in paragraph 1(r) for “£300.00” substitute “£315.00”.



Gibraltar Gazette, No. 4908, Thursday 21st October 2021

3

Dated: 21st October 2021.

F R PICARDO,
Minister responsible for finance.

________________________________________________

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM

These Regulations amend the Companies Act 2014 in order to provide for an increase in
certain fees set out in section 426 and Schedule 24 of the Act.


