
SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR 

GAZETTE 
No. 3814 of 7 October, 2010 

 

 

LEGAL NOTICE NO. 152 OF 2010. 

 

COMPANIES ACT 

 

COMPANIES (CROSS-BORDER MERGERS) REGULATIONS 2010 

 

NOTICE OF CORRIGENDUM 

 

 

In Legal Notice No. 151 of 2010− 

 

(a) in regulation 8(5) for “2 months” substitute “1 month”; and 

 

(b) in regulation 8(6) for “1 month” substitute “2 weeks”. 

 



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No 3814, Thursday 7 October, 2010 

 

 1118 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 


