SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR
GAZETTE

No.4908 GIBRALTAR Thursday 21st October 2021

LEGAL NOTICE NO. 430 OF 2021

BUSINESSNAMES REGISTRATION ACT
BUSINESSNAMES (AMENDMENT) RULES 2021

In exercise of the powers conferred upon him by section 19 of the Business Names
Registration Act, and al other enabling powers, the Minister has made the following Rules-

Title.
1. These Rules may be cited as the Business Names (Amendment) Rules 2021.
Commencement.
2. These Rules shall come into operation on 1% January 2022.
Amendment of rule9 of the Business Names Rules.
3. Rule 9(h) of the Business Names Rules is amended as follows-
(@ in subparagraph (ii) for “£5.00” substitute “£15.00”;
(b) in subparagraph (iii) for “£0.50” substitute “£15.00”"; and

(c) insubparagraph (iv) for “£0.25” substitute “£10.00".

Dated: 21% October 2021.

F R PICARDO,
Minister with responsibility for finance.

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM

These Rules amend the Business Names Rules in order to increase certain fees set out in rule
9.



