SECOND SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR

GAZETTE
No. 2,293 of 5th JUNE, 1986

LEGAL NOTICE No. 57 OF 1986.

BUREAUX DE CHANGE ORDINANCE.

BUREAUX DE CHANGE ORDER, 1986.

In exercise of the powers conferred on him by Section 37 of the Bureaux de
Change Ordinance, and of all other enabling powers, the Governor has made
the following order:

Title.

1. This order may be cited as the Bureaux de Change Order, 1986.

Amendment of Schedule 1.

2. Schedule 1 to the Bureaux de Change Ordinance is amended-

(@)

(b)

(©

(d)

(€)

(f)

by omitting the expression "£1" appearing in item 1 thereof,
and substituting therefor the expression "£2";

by omitting the expression "£10" appearing in item 2 thereof,
and substituting therefor the expression "£15";

by omitting the expression "£100" appearing in item 3 thereof,
and substituting therefor the expression "£200";

by omitting the expression "£5" appearing in item 4 thereof,
and substituting therefor the expression "£10";

by omitting the expression '1100" appearing in item 5 thereof,
and substituting therefor the expression "£150";

by omitting the expression "£10" appearing in item 6 thereof,
and substituting therefor the expression "£15".

Dated this 5th day of June, 1986.

By Command,



GIBRALTAR GAZETTE, No. 2,293, Thursday 5th June, 1986.

J. K. E. BROADLEY,

Deputy Governor.



