
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

THIRD SUPPLEMENT TO THE GIBRALTAR 
GAZETTE 

No. 3,767 of 18th February, 2010 
 

 

 

B. 11/10 
 

BILL 
 

FOR 
 

AN ACT to amend the Police Act 2006. 
 

ENACTED by the Legislature of Gibraltar. 
 
Title and commencement. 
 
1.  This Act may be cited as the Police (Amendment) Act 2010 and comes 
into operation on the day of publication. 
 
Amendment of the Police Act 2006. 
 
2.(1)  The Police Act 2006 is amended in accordance with this section.  
 
  (2)  In section 4(1) of the Police Act 2006 for “seven members” substitute 
“ten members”. 
 
  (3)  In section 4(1)(c) of the Police Act 2006 for “four members” substitute 
“seven members”. 
 
  (4)  In section 4(6) of the Police Act 2006 after the words “may be 
appointed by the person” insert the words “so empowered under subsection 
(1)”. 
 
  (5)  In section 6(1) of the Police Act 2006 for “five members” substitute 
“six members”. 
 
  (6)  In section 6(1)(b) of the Police Act 2006 for “four other members” 
substitute “five other members”. 
 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Police (Amendment) Act 2010      [B. 11/10] 
 

 86

  (7)  In section 9(1) after the words “the Authority” insert “whereupon it 
shall come into effect”. 
 

_________________ 
 

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM 
 

This Bill amends the Police Act 2006 by increasing the membership of the 
Gibraltar Police Authority from 7 members to 10 members and increases the 
quorum at meetings of the Authority from five members to six members. 
 
The Bill also clarifies when the Annual Policing Plan comes into effect. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
Printed by the Gibraltar Chronicle Limited 

Printing Office, 2, Library Gardens, 
Government Printers for Gibraltar, 

Copies may be purchased at 6, Convent Place, Price £0.30p 
 
 


